

2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

TRIPP COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT	IMPROVEMENTS
1 TR11360	SW4SW4 of Section 13 T100N, R74W	<u>39.06</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$898.38 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,015.56		FARM GRASS HAY		
2 RS-4284	NW4 of Section 12 T99N, R76W	<u>79</u> FARM <u>74.50</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,110.50 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$7,151.00		FARM GRASS HAY		
3 RS-2281-5A & RS-2281- 5B	NE4 & SE4 Section 2 T95N, R77W	<u>25</u> FARM <u>280</u> GRASS <u>15</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$7,965.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$9,410.00		FARM GRASS HAY		
4 RS-2821	SE4 Section 2 T99N, R74W	<u>145</u> FARM <u>2</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,281.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$9,622.00		FARM GRASS HAY		
5 T2744-A	Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 of Sec 1 T99N, R74W	<u>144.07</u> FARM <u>14</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,517.01 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$9,872.62		FARM GRASS HAY		
6 RS-4725	An undivided 57254340/57657600 interest in and to NW4 Section 12 T96N, R74W	<u>145</u> FARM GRASS <u>6</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED	
7 RS-2774-5	An undivided 2132356398480/2138802019200 interest in and to Lots 3, 4, S2NW4 of Sec. 5 T99N., R74W	<u>151.50</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED	
8 RS-2774	An undivided 76267800/7654500 interest in and to Lot 2, S2NE4NE4, S2NE4 of Sec. 6 T99N., R74W	<u>56</u> FARM GRASS <u>81.86</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED	
9 RS-2718	Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 Section 2 T99N, R74W	<u>114.08</u> FARM GRASS <u>34.11</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,928.74 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,620.08		FARM GRASS HAY		

2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

TRIPP COUNTY

10	RS-4782 & RS-4783	Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 & SE4 Section 1 T101N, R74W	<u>180</u> FARM GRASS <u>123</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$11,430.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$15,816.00		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
11	RS-4813	NW4 Section 20, T102N, R76W	<u>91</u> FARM GRASS <u>69</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,500.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$7,800.00		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
12	T4136	NE4 of Sec. 30 T97N., R74W	<u>126</u> FARM GRASS <u>20</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,018.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,956.00		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
13	RS-4256	SW4 Section 4, T97N, R75W	<u>85</u> FARM GRASS <u>71</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,288.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$7,456.00		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
14	RS-1829-A	NW4 of Sec.9 T102N., R75W	<u>55</u> FARM GRASS <u>105</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,780.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$6,360.00		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
15	RS-4418-B	S2SE4 of Sec. 5 T99N., R76W	<u>66.30</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,850.90 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,375.80		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
16	RS-2871	An undivided 312127942320/316412697600 interest in and to the NW4 Section 27, T100N, R74W	<u>110</u> FARM GRASS <u>7</u> HAY <u>39</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,960.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,840.00		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
17	RS-4089	S2 of Sec. 13 T97N., R79W	<u>55</u> FARM GRASS <u>227</u> HAY <u>32</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$8,546.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$10,556.00		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
18	RS-4564	an undivided 67240032/6858432 interest in & to SE4 Section 1 T102N, R74W	<u>120</u> FARM GRASS <u>40</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
19	RS-2677	an undivided 8971200/9072000 interest in & to E2SE4, Lots 5, 6, 7 & 8 of Sec 8 Lot 3 of Sec.5 N2NW4, SW4NW4 of Sec. 16 T103N, R74W	<u>50</u> FARM GRASS <u>258.74</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED

2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

TRIPP COUNTY

No.	Tract	Description	FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$	FARM GRASS HAY	FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
20	RS-2846	an undivided 233173987200/2347107 8400 interest in & to Lot 7, SE4SW4 of Sec. 2 T103N, R74W	<u>69.90</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$	FARM GRASS HAY	FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
21	RS-2373	an undivided 373102999696627200/37418529 9327840000 interest in & to Lots 4, 5, 6, 8, NE4SW4 of Sec. 31 T103N, R78W	<u>160.99</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,760.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,496.00	FARM GRASS HAY	FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
22	T4190-5	SE4 Section 32, T97N, R74W	<u>48</u> FARM <u>72</u> GRASS <u>38</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,860.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$6,256.00	FARM GRASS HAY	FARM GRASS HAY	
23	RS-4817	Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 Section 4, T102N, R74W	<u>102</u> FARM GRASS <u>55.66</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,055.80 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,513.12	FARM GRASS HAY	FARM GRASS HAY	
24	RS-1337	NE4 of Sec. 28 T98N., R74W	<u>160</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,680.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,160.00	FARM GRASS HAY	FARM GRASS HAY	
25	T4304	Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 of Sec. 4 T99N., R78W	<u>80</u> FARM <u>77.16</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,214.68 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$7,286.16	FARM GRASS HAY	FARM GRASS HAY	
26	RS-2870 & RS-2870-5	E2SW4, SE4 & W2NE4, NW4 of Sec. 14 T100N., R74W	<u>480</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$11,040.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$12,480.00	FARM GRASS HAY	FARM GRASS HAY	
27	RS-3764 & RS-3777	NW4NW4, S2NW4, SW4 of Sec. 25 & E2 of Sec. 13 T102N., R78W	<u>600</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$13,800.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$15,600.00	FARM GRASS HAY	FARM GRASS HAY	
28	RS-2643-5	Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 & SE4 of Sec. 4 T101N., R76W	<u>161</u> FARM <u>152.23</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$10,424.29 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$14,583.98	FARM GRASS HAY	FARM GRASS HAY	
29	RS-2746	An undivided 713304900/718502400 interest in and to the SE4NE4 Section 9, T100N, R74W	<u>40</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$	FARM GRASS HAY	FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED

2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

TRIPP COUNTY

30	RS-4916	SE4 of Sec. 20 T102N., R78W	<u>160</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,680.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,160.00		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
31	RS-3271	Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, E2W2 of Sec. 7 T102N., R77W	<u>313.08</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$7,200.84 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,140.08		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
32	RS-4767	SW4 Section 29 T101N, R74W	<u>135</u> FARM GRASS <u>21</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,435.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$9,582.00		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
33	RS-2808	SE4 Section 9, T101N, R74W	<u>109</u> FARM GRASS <u>47</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,097.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,698.00		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
34	T2630	NW4 of Sec. 20 T101N., R76W	<u>102.50</u> FARM <u>52.87</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,993.60 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,456.84		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
35	RS-4840	SW4 of Sec. 25 T101N., R77W	<u>87</u> FARM <u>73</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,931.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,078.00		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
36	RS-4366	N2N2SE4, N2S2N2SE4 of Sec. 30 T100N., R78W	<u>53</u> FARM GRASS <u>7</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,489.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,722.00		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
37	RS-3299	An undivided 1222412310/1234517760 interest in and to the NE4 Section 11, T101N, R77W	_____ FARM <u>158</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
38	T11677, T11681- BT11681-C & T11681-D	63.83 acres within the SW4 Section 25 T95N, R76W	_____ FARM _____ GRASS <u>63.83</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,914.90 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,042.56		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
39	RS-2632	An undivided 1566/1620 interest in and to the S2 Section 28, T101N, R76W	<u>145</u> FARM <u>167</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$10,076.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$13,912.00		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	

2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

TRIPP COUNTY

No.	Tract	Description	Acres	Use	Tribal Member Minimum Bid	Non-Member Minimum Bid	FARM	GRASS	HAY
40	T2661, T2662 & RS-2660	SE4, NE4 & Lots 1, 2, E2NW4 of Sec. 29 T37N., R28W	<u>475.38</u>	FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$10,933.74 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$12,371.58		FARM	GRASS	HAY
41	RS-4411	S2SE4 Section 28, T100N, R76W	<u>77</u>	FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,310.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,464.00		FARM	GRASS	HAY
42	RS-4779	N2NW4 Section 9 T102N, R74W	<u>80</u>	FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,840.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,080.00		FARM	GRASS	HAY
43	RS-1726 & RS-1726-A	An undivided 62099321684400/6693658171200 interest in and to the N2 & SW4 Section 14 & An undivided 61036836260400/6693658171200 interest in and to the SE4 Section 15, T102N, R77W	<u>640</u>	FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		FARM	GRASS	HAY
44	RS-118	An undivided 1434/1440 interest in and to the NE4 Section 20, T99N, R78W	<u>57</u> <u>102</u>	FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		FARM	GRASS	HAY
45	T3306	NE4 of Sec. 27 T99N., R76W	<u>69</u> <u>79</u> <u>8</u>	FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,024.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$6,864.00		FARM	GRASS	HAY
46	RS-6466	An undivided 328803602400/359610451200 interest in & to the SW4 Section 28 T99N, R74W	<u>39</u> <u>120</u>	FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		FARM	GRASS	HAY
47	RS-4197	An undivided 254558184804000/25482885120000 interest in & to the SE4 Section 1 T97N, R78W	<u>160</u>	FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		FARM	GRASS	HAY
48	T4664	SE4 Section 15 T95N, R77W	<u>160</u>	FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,680.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,160.00		FARM	GRASS	HAY
49	T11251	Lots 1, 2, 3, SE4NW4, S2NE4 Section 5 T97N, R75W	<u>162</u> <u>74.66</u>	FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$8,683.18 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$12,633.16		FARM	GRASS	HAY

