

2023 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT GREGORY COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT
1	RS-467 NE4 Section 12 T96N, R70W	FARM 158.32 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,400.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
2	RS-638 An undivided 14536684562400/15937281360000 interest in and to the W2 Section 11 T96N, R70W	FARM 320 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,850.90 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,375.80		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
3	RS-2857 An undivided 27974835/28576800 in and to Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, E2W2 Section 18 T96N, R69W	FARM 314.66 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$7,865.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,651.50		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
4	RS-218-5A, RS-617 & RS- 955-5 SE4 Section 15 & N2 Section 15 & An undivided 43631280/44906400 in and to SW4 of Section 15 T96N, R70W	FARM 635.45 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$16,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$17,600.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
6	T2820 NE4 Section 8 T99N, R72W	134 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,422.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,844.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
7	RS-630 NE4 Section 33 T95N, R70W	96.50 FARM 58.50 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,673.50 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$7,977.75		FARM GRASS HAY	
8	RS-2862-B E2NE4 of Sec. 31 T100N., R73W	2 FARM 74 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,958.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,167.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
9	RS-942 SE4 Section 6 T95N, R69W	91 FARM 65 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,994.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,281.00		FARM GRASS HAY	

GREGORY COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT
10	RS-955-5 an undivided 43631280/44906400 interest in & to the N2SE4 Section 19 T95N, R69W	17 FARM 63 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,493.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,854.50		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
11	RS-2715 an undivided 1852620/1871100 interest in & to the NE4 Section 33 T99N, R72W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,400.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
12	T11314 SE4 Sec. 11, SW4 Section 12 & N2NW4 Section 13, T95N, R72W	FARM 394 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$9,850.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$10,835.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
13	T-607 SE4 Section 29, T95N, R70W	FARM 74 GRASS 85 HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,570.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,010.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
14	T-11035 NW4 Section 10, T95N, R70W	41 FARM 86 GRASS 24 HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,132.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,911.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
15	RS-3296 An undivided 8651467440/8801654400 interest in and to the SW4 Section 21 T99N, R72W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,400.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
16	RS-271 An undivided 92232/95256 interest in and to N2 Section 9 T96N, R72W	120 FARM 200 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$11,480.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$13,420.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
17	RS-209-5 An undivided 850500/907200 interest in and to W2 Section 26 T96N, R72W	131.50 FARM 184.50 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,690.50 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$7,983.25		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
18	RS-2739-5 An undivided 54180/60480 interest in and to Lots 3, 4, S2NW4 Section 5	54.44 FARM 103.95 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,538.51 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$6,451.67		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED

GREGORY COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT DEPOSIT REQUIRED
19	1644020506573200/1672754572550880 interest in and to NW4 Section 14 T100N, R72W	160 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,400.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
20	An undivided 356700960/359251200 interest in and to NE4 Section 26 T96N, R72W	16 FARM 116 GRASS 28 HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,764.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,246.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
21	SW4 Section 25, T100N, R73W	FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,355.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,495.00		FARM GRASS HAY	