

2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

MELLETTE COUNTY

| Tract No. | LEGAL DESCRIPTION | ACRES | MINIMUM BID | No. of Years | BID PER ACRE | TOTAL AMOUNT | IMPROVEMENTS |
|----------------|---|-------------------------------------|---|--------------|----------------------|--|--------------|
| 1 T1582-A | E2NW4 of Section 35 T40N, R28W | 80 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$960.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,280.00 | | FARM GRASS HAY | | |
| 2 T3556 | Lots 3, 4, S2NW4 of Sec. 3 T41N, R26W | 158.45 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,980.63 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,614.43 | | FARM GRASS HAY | | |
| 3 T5597-A | S2NE4 Section 1 T41N, R26W | 68 11 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,279.50 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,561.50 | | FARM GRASS HAY | | |
| 4 T5594 | SE4 Section 6 T41N, R25W | 160 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00 | | FARM GRASS HAY | | |
| 5 T11617 | NE4 of Sec 23 T44N, R33W | 160 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00 | | FARM GRASS HAY | | |
| 6 RS-4045 | An undivided 23141653164000/2316625 9200000 interest in and to E2 Section 23 T44N, R31W | 200 120 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$7,800.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,980.00 | | FARM GRASS HAY | PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED | |
| 7 RS-5865-A | Lot 2, SE4NE4, of Sec. 30 T44N., R30W | 45 42.74 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,951.75 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,280.21 | | FARM GRASS HAY | | |
| 8 RS-2395-5 | An undivided 388290/388800 interest in and to Lots 6, 7, E2SW4, SE4 Section 6 T42N, R28W | 328.13 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,101.63 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,414.15 | | FARM GRASS HAY | PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED | |
| 9 RS-1363 | SW4 Section 4 T40N, R26W | 160 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00 | | FARM GRASS HAY | | |

2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

MELLETT COUNTY

| No. | RS# | Description | Acres | FARM | GRASS | HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ | Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$ | FARM | GRASS | HAY | Bid Type |
|-----|---------------------------------|--|---------------------------------------|------|-------|-----|-------------------------------|----------------------------|------|-------|-----|---|
| 10 | RS-511 | An undivided 114576/127008 interest in and to S2 Section 11 T40N, R27W | <u>62</u> <u>130</u> <u>125</u> | FARM | GRASS | HAY | | | | | | PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 11 | RS-337-A, RS-337-5A & RS-337-5B | An undivided 15080/15120 interest in and to NW4 Section 22 & An undivided 22640/22680 interest in and to SE4 & An undivided 108800/108864 interest in and to NE4 of Sec. 21 T41N, R26W | <u>480</u> | FARM | GRASS | HAY | | | | | | PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 12 | RS-1551 | An undivided 59976/60480 interest in and to Lot 1, NE4NW4, S2NW4 of Sec. 13 T43N., R29W | <u>91</u> | FARM | GRASS | HAY | | | | | | PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 13 | RS-201 | Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 Section 1 T40N, R26W | <u>117</u> <u>73.95</u> | FARM | GRASS | HAY | | | | | | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,609.88 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,315.18 |
| 14 | T11106 | SW4 of Sec. 10 T41N., R26W | <u>150</u> <u>6</u> | FARM | GRASS | HAY | | | | | | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,800.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,349.00 |
| 15 | RS-131 | An undivided 405720/408240 interest in and to NW4 of Sec. 14 T41N., R27W | <u>56</u> <u>104</u> | FARM | GRASS | HAY | | | | | | PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 16 | RS-5635 | SW4 of Sec. 3 T41N., R27W | <u>160</u> | FARM | GRASS | HAY | | | | | | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00 |
| 17 | T5763 & T5745 | NW4 of Sec. 17 & NE4 of Sec. 18 T43N., R26W | <u>320</u> | FARM | GRASS | HAY | | | | | | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,280.00 |
| 18 | RS-856 | An undivided 278876757600/282910320 interest in and to SE4 of Sec. 22 T43N., R26W | <u>160</u> | FARM | GRASS | HAY | | | | | | PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED |

2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

MELLETT COUNTY

| No. | RS No. | Description | Acres | FARM | GRASS | HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ | Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$ | FARM | GRASS | HAY | Notes |
|-----|---------------------|---|--------------|------|-------|-----|---------------------------------------|------------------------------------|------|-------|-----|--|
| 28 | RS-2491 | Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 of Sec. 4 T42N., R29W | 159.18 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,989.75 | Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,626.47 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | |
| 29 | RS-748 | N2 Section 33 & W2NW4 Section 34 T42N, R29W | 77 110 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ | Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,120.00 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | |
| 30 | RS-2530 | An undivided 26066880/26127360 interest in and to Lots 1, 2, SE4NE4 of Sec. 3 T40N., R26W | 154.30 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ | Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$ | FARM | GRASS | HAY | PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 31 | RS-5750 | SE4 of Sec. 28 T43N., R27W | 160 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 | Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | |
| 32 | RS-67-5 | An undivided 19320/20160 interest in and to Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, S2N2 of Sec. 2 T41N., R25W | 319.32 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ | Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$ | FARM | GRASS | HAY | PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 33 | RS-67 | An undivided 2760/2880 interest in and to Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, S2N2 of Sec. 3 T41N., R25W | 13 307.60 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ | Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$ | FARM | GRASS | HAY | PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 34 | RS-4074 | Lots 1, 2, 3, 7 & 8 Section 1 T44N, R31W; Lot 1 Section 6 T44N, R30W; Lot 4 Section 32 T45N, R30W | 42 123.57 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,867.63 | Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,508.91 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | |
| 35 | RS-2175 & RS-2175-5 | An undivided 181440/211680 interest in and to N2 & SE4 of Sec. 22 T40N., R33W | 330 80 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ | Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$ | FARM | GRASS | HAY | PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 36 | T541 | NW4 of Sec. 27 T41N., R26W | 160 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 | Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | |
| 37 | T348 | SE4 of Sec. 27 T41N., R26W | 160 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 | Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00 | FARM | GRASS | HAY | |

2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

MELLETT COUNTY

| No. | RS# | Description | Acres | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$ | FARM GRASS HAY | PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
|-----|---------------------|--|-------------|----------------------|---|----------------------|--|
| 38 | RS-343 | an undivided 15080/15120 interest in & to the NE4 Section 22 T41N, R26W | 160 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$ | FARM GRASS HAY | PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 39 | RS-349 | SE4 Section 35 T41N, R26W | 160 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 40 | RS-2540-A & T2540-B | Lot 2, N2SE4 Sec. 35 & NW4SW4 of Sec. 36 T45N., R31W | 158.56 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,435.36 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,250.48 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 41 | RS-4008-5A | SE4 of Sec. 4 T44N., R31W | 100 60 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,900.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,490.00 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 41 | RS-4005 | SW4 of Sec. 35 T45N., R31W | 160 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 41 | T5843 | SE4 of Sec. 24 T43N., R29W | 149 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,862.50 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,458.50 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 41 | RS-2401 | an undivided 1404/1440 interest in & to the Lots 1, 2, E2NW4 Section 19 T43N, R28W | 82 69.87 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$ | FARM GRASS HAY | PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 41 | T796B & T5747 | S2N2 & SE4 of Sec. 21 T43N., R27W | 320 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,280.00 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 41 | T26 | SW4 of Sec. 17 T41N., R26W | 90 59 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,572.50 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,123.50 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 41 | T5739 | SW4 of Sec. 4 T41N., R26W | 86 74 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,634.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,231.00 | FARM GRASS HAY | |

2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

MELLETT COUNTY

| # | Tract | Description | Acres | FARM GRASS HAY | Bids | FARM GRASS HAY | FARM GRASS HAY |
|----|---------------------|---|----------------|----------------------|---|----------------------|----------------------|
| 42 | RS-5402 | Lot 2, NW4NW4, S2NW4 of Sec. 9 T43N., R29W | 135 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,687.50 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,227.50 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 43 | T339 & T341 & T3854 | NW4 of Sec.21 & SE4 of Sec. 17 & SE4 of Sec. 16 T41N., R26W | 115 355 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$8,060.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$9,882.50 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 44 | T5579 | NE4 of Sec. 11 T40N., R26W | 102 58 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,938.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,527.00 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 45 | T1546-B | SE4 of Sec. 31 T43N., R29W | 160 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 46 | T3758 & T3758-A | Lots 3, 4 S2S2NW4 & N2S2NW4 of Sec. 4 T42N., R27W | 156.49 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,929.44 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,477.15 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 47 | T5665 | SE4 of Sec. 15 T42N., R26W | 91.40 68.60 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,148.20 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,708.20 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 48 | T11299 | NW4 of Sec. 13 T42N., R26W | 58 3 99 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,696.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,257.50 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 49 | T11748 | NE4 of Sec. 13 T42N., R26W | 160 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 50 | T6053 | NE4 of Sec. 20 T41N., R31W | 103 57 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,342.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,953.50 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 51 | T6045 | Lots 1, 2, 3, SE4NE4 of Sec. 6 T40N., R31W | 38.82 154 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,334.25 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,028.53 | FARM GRASS HAY | |

2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

MELLETTE COUNTY

| No. | Tract | Section | Acres | Farming Use | Bidding Information | Farming Use |
|-----|-----------------|--|--------------|----------------------|---|----------------------|
| 52 | T1976 | N2N2 of Sec. 25 T41N., R33W | 104 56 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,976.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,564.00 | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 53 | T5634 & T5633 | SW4 & SE4 of Sec. 9 T41N., R27W | 320 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,280.00 | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 54 | T566 | SE4 of Sec. 5 T41N., R27W | 160 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00 | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 55 | T555 | N2 of Sec. 34 T42N., R27W | 51 269 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,969.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$6,223.50 | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 56 | T5760 | Lots 1, 2, E2NW4 of Sec. 7 T43N., R27W | 103 62.30 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,023.25 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,632.95 | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 57 | T11283 | SW4 of Sec. 11 T43N., R28W | 160 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00 | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 58 | T11627 | NW4NE4 of Sec. 17 T43N., R25W | 40 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$500 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$660.00 | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 60 | T11111 & T11126 | Lots 2, 3, 4, SW4NW4 of Sec. 2 Lot 1 & 5, N2SE4, S2SW4, SENE4, SW4SE4 of Sec. 3 Lot 1, W2E2, SW4, SE4NE4 of Sec. 10 Lot 1 of Sec. 11 N2NW4 of Sec. 15 T43N., R29W | 68 771.67 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$11,787.88 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$15,112.56 | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 61 | T95-D | S2NE4 of Sec. 16 T42N., R27W | 80 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,320.00 | FARM GRASS HAY |

2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

MELLETT COUNTY

| No. | Tract | Acres | Use | Bids | Use | Bids |
|-----|------------------------|---|-------------------------------|---|----------------------|------|
| 62 | T11048 | SE4 of Sec. 10 T42N., R27W | 160 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 63 | T58, T5656 & T11025 | NW4 & N2SW4 of Sec. 25 & SW4 of Sec. 24 T42N., R26W | 397.50 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,968.75 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$6,558.75 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 64 | T11598 | W2 of Sec. 35 T44N., R30W | 320 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,280.00 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 65 | T929 | W2 of Sec. 15 T43N., R30W | 320 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,280.00 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 67 | T11217 | Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 of Sec. 1 T43N., R28W | 157.50 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,961.25 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,512.50 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 68 | T3035 | NW4 of Sec. 36 T41N., R28W | 80 FARM 60 GRASS 20 HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,640.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,230.00 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 69 | T3036 | N2NE4, SW4NE4 of Sec. 16 T40N., R27W | 120 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,500.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,980.00 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 70 | T11024 | SW4 of Sec. 34 T40N., R26W | 160 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 71 | T458-B & T458-C | NW4 & SW4 of Sec. 26 T40N., R27W | 320 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,280.00 | FARM GRASS HAY | |
| 72 | TR11625 | W2SE4 of Sec. 27 T43N., R25W | 77.5 FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$968.75 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,278.75 | FARM GRASS HAY | |

2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

MELLETT COUNTY

| | | | | | | | |
|----|---------|---|----------|----------------------|---|--|----------------------|
| 73 | T11613 | S2SE4 Section 26 T42N, R33W | 80 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$960.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,280.00 | | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 74 | TR11673 | NE4 Section 36 T41N, R27W | 131 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,637.50 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,161.50 | | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 75 | T11606 | SW4NW4 of Sec. 23 T43N., R30W | 40 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$500.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$660.00 | | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 76 | RS-6525 | SW4 Section 21 T41N, R26 W | 62 98 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,178.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,787.00 | | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 77 | T11715 | NE4SW4 Section 8, T44N, R30W | 32 8 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$500 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$660.00 | | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 78 | T11683 | N2NW4 Section 29 T42N, R32W | 40 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$500.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$660.00 | | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 79 | T1986-A | NE4SE4SW4, SE4NE4SW4, S2N2SE4, S2SE4 Section 24, T42N, R33W | 140 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,590.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,080.00 | | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 80 | T5864 | Lots 3 & 4 Section 19, T44N, R30W | 95.35 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,003.53 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,337.25 | | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 81 | T11310 | NW4SW4 Section 15, T44N, R30W | 40 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$500.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$660.00 | | FARM GRASS HAY |
| 82 | T11287 | S2NE4 Section 24, T41N, R26W | 80 | FARM GRASS HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,320.00 | | FARM GRASS HAY |

