

## 2023 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

		<b>TODD COUNTY</b>				
Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT
1	T912 South of the road in the SE4 of Section 29 T39N, R30W	FARM 75.82 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$758.20 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,213.12		FARM GRASS HAY	
2	T7704A & T7704B W2SW4 of Section 14 T35N, R32W: E2SW4 of Section 14 T35N, R32W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
3	T7866 NW4SE4 Section 16 T35N, R32W	FARM 40 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$400.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
4	T7539 NW4 Section 16 T35N, R32W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
6	T1283-A E2SE4 Section 35 T39N, R32W	FARM 73 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$730.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,168.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
7	T11322 NE4 Section 12 T37N, R30W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
8	T4085 SW4 Section 9 T37N, R27W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
9	T7214-A Lots 1, 2, Section 4 T38N, R26W	FARM 37.04 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$380.60 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$608.96		FARM GRASS HAY	
10	RS-7221 SE4 Section 1 T37N, R25W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,920.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
11	T7500 Lot 4, SE4SW4 of Sec 18 &	FARM 149.31 GRASS	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,493.10		FARM GRASS	

# TODD COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT
T7258	Lot 1 & 2 of Sec 19 T37N, R28W	HAY	Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,388.96		HAY	
T7299	Lot 4 of Sec. 6 Lots 1, 2 & 3 of Sec. 5 T36N., R28W	FARM 156.03 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,560.30 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,496.48		FARM GRASS HAY	
T6356	Lots 3, 4, S2NW4 of Sec. 2 T39N., R27W	FARM 159.82 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,598.20 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,557.12		FARM GRASS HAY	
T1006-D & T3881	SE4 & S2SW4 Section 2 T36N, R31W	FARM 230 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,440.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,680.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
RS-1006, RS-1006-B & RS-1006-C & T1006-A	Lot 1, 2, 3, 4, of Sec. 2 T36N., R31W	FARM 129.16 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,420.52 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,066.56		FARM GRASS HAY	
RS-6743	an undivided 420034/451584 interest in & to the SW4 Section 33 T38N, R25W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,920.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
T6751	SE4 Section 32 T38N, R25W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
RS-1118	W2 Section 13 T35N, R30W	FARM 320 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,840.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,120.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
RS-1750	An undivided 47320/48672 interest in and to SW4 Section 2 T36N, R30W	74 FARM 86 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,030.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,818.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
T5025	Lot 1, 2, 3, 4, of Sec. 20 T35N., R26W	FARM 149.52 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,495.20 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,392.32		FARM GRASS HAY	
T7478	NW4 of Sec. 12 T35N., R26W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	

# TODD COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT
22	RS-7059 & T7060 an undivided 2937537603000/2942267328000 interest in & to the SW4 & SE4 Section 21 T36N, R26W	FARM 320 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,520.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,120.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
23	T3894 E2SW4, SW4SE4 of Sec. 5 T36N., R28W	FARM 120 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,200.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,920.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
24	T7109 NE4 of Sec. 33 T37N., R28W	80 FARM 20 GRASS 60 HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,700.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,280.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
25	T3700 W2SW4 of Sec. 5 T36N., R28W	FARM 80 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$800.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,280.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
26	RS-1792 NW4 of Sec. 34 T37N., R29W	95 FARM 65 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,345.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,175.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
27	RS-1831 An undivided 22638000/27216000 interest in and to W2 Section 12 T35N, R31W	FARM 320 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,520.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,120.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
28	RS-6758 NE4 Section 12 T37N, R25W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
29	RS-1007 & RS-3882 NE4 & NW4 Section 11 T36N, R31W	FARM 320 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,840.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,120.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
30	T900-B NW4NE4 Section 14 T39N, R30W	FARM 40 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$400.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
31	T11242 NW4 Section 21 T36N, R26W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	

# TODD COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT
32	SE4 of Sec. 19 T39N., R28W	FARM GRASS 26 HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$540.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$792.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
33	NE4 Section 34 T36N, R30W	20 FARM 133.78 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,145.36 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,800.48		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
34	An undivided 1491683113956/1503000878400 interest in and to N2NW4, W2NE4 Section 10 T37N, R29W	FARM 156.64 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,879.68 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,506.24		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
35	S2NW4 & SW4 of Section 10 T37N, R29W	60 FARM 180 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,780.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,860.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
36	NE4 of Section 9 T39N, R32W	144 FARM GRASS 16 HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,168.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,104.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
37	Lot 3, SE4NW4, NE4SW4 Section 6 T37N, R26W	FARM 120 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,200.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,920.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
38	NE4 of Sec. 8 T39N., R32W	160 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,120.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,144.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
39	E2E2 of Sec. 9, NW4; E2SE4SW4SW4SW4; N2SW4SW4SW4; NW4SW4SW4; S2SW4NW4SW4; W2SW4SW4SW4SW4; E2E2SW4; E2W2E2SW4; N2NW4SW4; N2S2NW4SW4; NW4SW4NE4SW4; W2NW4NE4SW4; N2NE4SW4SW4; NW4NW4SE4SW4; S2SE4NW4SW4; SW4SW4NE4SW4; S2NE4SW4SW4; SE4SW4SW4; SW4NW4SE4SW4; W2SW4SE4SW of Sec. 10, T38N, R32W	FARM 237.55 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,719.74 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,800.80		FARM GRASS HAY	
	T1866-5, RS-4116-A, RS-5309-B, RS-5309-D, T5309-C, T5309-A & T5309-E					

# TODD COUNTY

No.	Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT
40	RS-1871-B & T1871-C	S2NW4 & N2NW4 Section 15 T38N, R32W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,760.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
41	T1765	Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 Section 5 T37N, R30W	FARM 71.55 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$715.50 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,144.80		FARM GRASS HAY	
42	T1848	NE4 Section 15 T38N, R32W	FARM 100 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
43	T3663	SE4SW4 Section 21 T38N, R32W	FARM 32.59 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$325.90 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$521.44		FARM GRASS HAY	
44	T1856	E2NW4, NE4 Section 11 T38N, R32W	FARM 240 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,400.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,840.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
45	RS-1847, RS-1847-A & RS-6077	An undivided 728/756 interest in and to E2NW4, W2NW4 Section 14 & An undivided interest in and to SW4 Section 11 T38N, R32W	FARM 185.90 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,230.80 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,974.40		FARM GRASS HAY	
46	RS-2438, RS-4675, T2229-A, T2229-B, RS-1637-5, T1637-A & T11511	An undivided 10446540/10483200 interest in and to Lots 3, 5, E2SW4, NE4SW4SW4 Sec. 7, Lots 1, 2, E2NW4 of Sec. 7, North of road in W2SE4 of Sec. 7, E2SE4 of Sec. 7 & Lots 3, 4, E2SW4, SE4, NE4, Lots 1, 2, E2NW4 of Sec. 18 T38N, R32W	FARM 1,014.90 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$11,368.82 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$16,238.56		FARM GRASS HAY	
47	RS-283	An undivided 1050/1200 interest in and to N2NW4, W2NE4 Section 10 T37N, R29W	FARM 149.60 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,345.20 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,310.80		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED