

2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

GREGORY COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT	IMPROVEMENTS
1 T2815	SE4 Section 4 T99N, R72W	<u>160</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,400.00		FARM GRASS HAY		
2 RS-209-5	An undivided 850500/907200 interest in and to W2 Section 26 T96N, R72W	<u>94.50</u> FARM <u>63.50</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED	
3 RS-630	NE4 Section 33 T95N, R70W	<u>96.50</u> FARM <u>58.50</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,673.50 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$7,977.75		FARM GRASS HAY		
4 RS-942	SE4 Section 6 T95N, R69W	<u>91</u> FARM GRASS <u>65</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,994.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,281.00		FARM GRASS HAY		
5 RS-271	An undivided 92232/95256 interest in and to N2 Section 9 T96N, R72W	<u>120</u> FARM <u>200</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED	
6 T11314	SE4 Sec. 11, SW4 Section 12 & N2NW4 Section 13, T95N, R72W	FARM <u>394</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$9,850.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$10,835.00		FARM GRASS HAY		
7 RS-2862-B	E2NE4 of Sec. 31 T100N., R73W	<u>2</u> FARM <u>74</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,958.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,167.00		FARM GRASS HAY		
8 RS-955-5	an undivided 43631280/44906400 interest in & to the N2SE4 Section 19 T95N, R69W	<u>17</u> FARM <u>63</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED	
9 RS-2769	Lots 3, 4, S2NW4 Section 3, T98N, R71W	<u>142</u> FARM <u>15.84</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$8,064.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$9,807.60		FARM GRASS HAY		

2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

GREGORY COUNTY

No.	Tract	Description	FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$	FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
10	RS-2715	an undivided 1852620/1871100 interest in & to the NE4 Section 33 T99N, R72W	<u>160</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$	FARM GRASS HAY	
11	RS-11035	NW4 Section 10, T95N, R70W	<u>41</u> FARM <u>86</u> GRASS <u>24</u> HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,132.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,911.00	FARM GRASS HAY	
12	RS-3296	An undivided 8651467440/8801654400 interest in and to the SW4 Section 21 T99N, R72W	<u>160</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$	FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
13	RS-2832-5	an undivided 107100/120960 interest in & to the SE4 Section 10 T98N, R72W	<u>160</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$	FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
14	RS-467	NE4 Section 12 T96N, R70W	<u>160</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,400.00	FARM GRASS HAY	
15	RS-638	An undivided 14536684562400/159372813600 interest in and to the W2 Section 11 T96N, R70W	<u>320</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,850.90 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,375.80	FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
16	RS-2857	An undivided 27974835/28576800 in and to Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, E2W2 Section 18 T96N, R69W	<u>314.60</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$	FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
17	RS-2730	An undivided 72462600/73483200 interest in and to the SE4 Section 9 T98N, R72W	<u>160</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$	FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
19	T11036	S2SE4 Section 10 & S2SW4 Section 11 T95N, R70W	<u>130</u> FARM <u>25.50</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,066.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,467.50	FARM GRASS HAY	
20	RS-218-5A, RS-617 & RS-955-5	SE4 Section 15 & N2 Section 15 & An undivided 43631280/44906400 in and to SW4 of Section 15 T96N, R70W	<u>640</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$	FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED

