

# 2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

## TODD COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT	IMPROVEMENTS
1	T912	South of the road in the SE4 of Section 29 T39N, R30W	<u>75.82</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$909.84 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,213.12		FARM GRASS HAY	
2	T7704A & T7704B	W2SW4 of Section 14 T35N, R32W; E2SW4 of Section 14 T35N, R32W	<u>160</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,920.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
3	T7866	NW4SE4 Section 16 T35N, R32W	<u>40</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$480.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
4	T7539	NW4 Section 16 T35N, R32W	<u>160</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,920.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
5	T7238	Lot 4, SE4SW4 of Sec 18 & Lot 1 & 2 of Sec 19 T37N, R28W	<u>149.31</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,791.72 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,388.96		FARM GRASS HAY	
6	T1006-D & T3881	SE4 & S2SW4 Section 2 T36N, R31W	<u>230</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,760.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,680.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
7	RS-1006, RS-1006-B & RS-1006-C & T1006-A	Lot 1, 2, 3, 4, of Sec. 2 T36N., R31W	<u>129.16</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,549.92 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,066.56		FARM GRASS HAY	
8	T6751	SE4 Section 32 T38N, R25W	<u>160</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,920.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
9	RS-1118	W2 Section 13 T35N, R30W	<u>320</u> FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,840.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,120.00		FARM GRASS HAY	

# 2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

## TODD COUNTY

#	Tract	Description	Acres	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$	Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$	FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
10	RS-1750	An undivided 47320/48672 interest in and to SW4 Section 2 T36N, R30W	$\frac{74}{86}$ FARM GRASS HAY			FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
11	T5025	Lot 1, 2, 3, 4, of Sec. 20 T35N., R26W	$\frac{149.52}{}$ FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,794.24 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,392.32		FARM GRASS HAY	
12	T7478	NW4 of Sec. 12 T35N., R26W	$\frac{160}{}$ FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,920.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
13	RS-7059 & T7060	an undivided 2937537603000/2942267328000 interest in & to the SW4 & SE4 Section 21 T36N, R26W	$\frac{320}{}$ FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
14	T5420	NE4 of Sec. 9 T36N., R25W	$\frac{70}{90}$ FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,970.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,750.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
15	T5418	SE4 of Sec. 4 T36N., R25W	$\frac{120}{40}$ FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,960.0 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,840.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
16	T5419	NW4 of Sec. 9 T36N., R25W	$\frac{104}{56}$ FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,480.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,328.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
17	T1025	NE4 of Sec. 28 T36N., R30W	$\frac{160}{}$ FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,920.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
18	RS-1088, RS-6160, RS-6169, T1086-D, T1086-C, T1086-E, T1087-, T4185 & T1086-F	NW4, NE4, N2SE4, S2SE4 of Sec. 15 NW4 & NE4 of Sec. 23 N2 & SW4 of Sec. 27 SE4 of Sec. 16 T36N., R31W	$\frac{1,440}{}$ FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$17,280.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$23,040.00		FARM GRASS HAY	

# 2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

## TODD COUNTY

No.	Tract	Description	Acres	FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$	Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$	FARM GRASS HAY
19	T3921	NE4 of Sec. 21 T38N., R27W	160	FARM GRASS HAY	\$1,920.00	\$2,560.00	FARM GRASS HAY
20	RS-7523	Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 of Sec. 6 T38N., R26W	160.30	FARM GRASS HAY	\$1,923.60	\$2,564.80	FARM GRASS HAY
21	RS-3694	SW4 of Sec. 23 T37N., R29W	160	FARM GRASS HAY	\$1,920.00	\$2,560.00	FARM GRASS HAY
22	T11215	SE4 of Sec. 26 T39N., R25W	25 135	FARM GRASS HAY	\$2,295.00	\$2,985.00	FARM GRASS HAY
23	RS-5486	NW4 of Sec. 35 T39N., R25W	56 92 8	FARM GRASS HAY	\$2,760.00	\$3,496.00	FARM GRASS HAY
24	T11214	SE4 of Sec. 20 T39N., R25W	118 10 32	FARM GRASS HAY	\$3,882.00	\$4,758.00	FARM GRASS HAY
25	T6416	SW4 of Sec. 17 T38N., R27W	147.50	FARM GRASS HAY	\$1,770.00	\$2,360.00	FARM GRASS HAY
26	T657 & T657-A	W2SE4 & E2SE4 of Sec. 16 T39N., R29W	150.44	FARM GRASS HAY	\$1,805.28	\$2,407.04	FARM GRASS HAY
27	RS-1697	E2 of Sec. 26 T39N., R31W	320	FARM GRASS HAY	\$3,840.00	\$5,120.00	FARM GRASS HAY
28	RS-5242	NE4 of Sec. 16 T39N., R29W	160	FARM GRASS HAY	\$1,920.00	\$2,560.00	FARM GRASS HAY

# 2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

## TODD COUNTY

No.	Tract	Description	Acres	Use	Tribal Member Minimum Bid	Non-Member Minimum Bid	Use	Tribal Member Minimum Bid	Non-Member Minimum Bid
29	T5319	Lots 3, 4, S2NW4 of Sec. 2 T38N., R29W	<u>50</u> FARM GRASS <u>30.50</u> HAY		Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,899.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,321.00		FARM GRASS HAY		
30	T659	SW4 of Sec. 15 & NE4 of Sec. 22 T39N., R29W	<u>320</u> FARM GRASS HAY		Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,840.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,120.00		FARM GRASS HAY		
31	T7423	Lot 1, NE4NW4 of Sec. 7 T37N., R28W	<u>74.81</u> FARM GRASS HAY		Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$897.72 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,196.96		FARM GRASS HAY		
32	T5503	NW4 of Sec. 13 T39N., R25W	<u>160</u> FARM GRASS HAY		Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,920.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY		
33	T134	SE4 of Sec. 13 T39N., R28W	<u>160</u> FARM GRASS HAY		Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,920.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,560.00		FARM GRASS HAY		
34	RS-483	an undivided 8289248370/8581613040 interest in & to the N2 Section 11 T39N, R28W	<u>320</u> FARM GRASS HAY		Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,840.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,120.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED	
35	T3894	E2SW4, SW4SE4 of Sec. 5 T36N., R28W	<u>120</u> FARM GRASS HAY		Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,440.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,920.00		FARM GRASS HAY		
36	T7299	Lot 4 of Sec. 6 Lots 1, 2 & 3 of Sec. 5 T36N., R28W	<u>156.03</u> FARM GRASS HAY		Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,872.36 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,496.48		FARM GRASS HAY		
37	T7109	NE4 of Sec. 33 T37N., R28W	<u>80</u> FARM <u>20</u> GRASS <u>60</u> HAY		Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,480.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,280.00		FARM GRASS HAY		
38	T3700	W2SW4 of Sec. 5 T36N., R28W	<u>80</u> FARM GRASS HAY		Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$960 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,280.00		FARM GRASS HAY		

# 2019 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT

## TODD COUNTY

39	RS-1792	NW4 of Sec. 34 T37N., R29W	<u>95</u> FARM <u>65</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,345.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,175.00		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
40	RS-6743	an undivided 420034/451584 interest in & to the SW4 Section 33 T38N, R25W	_____ FARM <u>160</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
41	T383	Lots 3, 4, 5, SE4NW4 of Sec. 6 T39N., R25W	<u>110</u> FARM <u>38.78</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,435.36 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,250.48		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	
42	RS-5309 & RS-5311 & RS-5276	an undivided 142/144 interest in & to the NW4 & an undivided 1132110/1143072 interest in & to the SE4 of Sec. 14 and an undivided 27027/27216 interest in & to the NE4 of Sec. 23 T37N., R28W	_____ FARM <u>480</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
36	T6356	Lots 3, 4, S2NW4 of Sec. 2 T39N., R27W	_____ FARM <u>159.82</u> GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,917.84 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,557.12		_____ FARM _____ GRASS _____ HAY	