

## 2023 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT TRIPP COUNTY

| Tract No. | LEGAL DESCRIPTION   | ACRES                            | MINIMUM BID  | No. of Years | BID PER ACRE         | TOTAL AMOUNT                                     |
|-----------|---|----------------------------------|--|--------------|----------------------|--|
| 1         | TR11360<br>SW4SW4 of Section 13 T100N,<br>R74W  | FARM<br>39.06 GRASS<br>HAY       | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$468.72<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,015.56    |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 2         | T4858<br>NE4 Section 8 T102N, R77W  | 75 FARM<br>83 GRASS<br>HAY       | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,471.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$7,108.00  |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 3         | RS-2739-5<br>An undivided 54180/60480 interest in<br>and to Lots 3, 4, S2NW4 Section 5<br>T99N, R73W          | 54.44 FARM<br>89.95 GRASS<br>HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3950.42<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5313.85    |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID ONLY<br>NO BID DEPOSIT<br>REQUIRED |
| 4         | RS-4354<br>An undivided 31/32 interest in and to<br>NE4 Section 22 T99N, R79W                                 | 148 FARM<br>7 GRASS<br>HAY       | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,525.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$9,950.00  |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID ONLY<br>NO BID DEPOSIT<br>REQUIRED |
| 5         | RS-2871<br>An undivided<br>312127942320/316412697600 interest<br>in and to the NW4 Section 27, T100N,<br>R74W | 110 FARM<br>7 GRASS<br>39 HAY    | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,960.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,840.00  |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID<br>ONLY NO BID<br>DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 6         | RS-4813<br>NW4 Section 20, T102N, R76W  | 91 FARM<br>69 GRASS<br>HAY       | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,500.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$7,800.00  |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 7         | T4136<br>NE4 of Sec. 30 T97N., R74W   | 136 FARM<br>GRASS<br>20 HAY      | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,458.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,956.00  |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 8         | RS-4256<br>SW4 Section 4, T97N, R75W  | 85 FARM<br>71 GRASS<br>HAY       | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,288.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$7,456.00  |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 9         | T11251<br>Lots 1, 2, 3, SE4NW4, S2NE4 Section<br>5 T97N, R75W   | 162 FARM<br>74.66 GRASS<br>HAY   | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,241.92<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$12,633.16 |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 10        | an undivided  | FARM                             | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,607.70  |              | FARM                 | PER ACRES BID                                    |

# TRIPP COUNTY

| Tract No.         | LEGAL DESCRIPTION  | ACRES                          | MINIMUM BID   | No. of Years | BID PER ACRE         | TOTAL AMOUNT                                     |
|-------------------|--|--------------------------------|---|--------------|----------------------|--|
| RS-2846           | 233173957200723471075400 interest in & to Lot 7, SE4SW4 of Sec. 2 T103N, R74W  | 69.90 FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY     | Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,817.40  |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | ONLY NO BID<br>DEPOSIT REQUIRED                  |
| RS-4564           | an undivided 6724032/6858432 interest in & to SE4 Section 1 T102N, R74W  | 120 FARM<br>GRASS<br>40 HAY    | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,360.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$9,200.00   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID<br>ONLY NO BID<br>DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| RS-2677           | an undivided 8971200/9072000 interest in & to E2SE4, Lots 5, 6, 7 & 8 of Sec 8 Lot 3 of Sec.5 N2NW4, SW4NW4 of Sec. 16 T103N, R74W | 50 FARM<br>258.74 GRASS<br>HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$8,101.02<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$10,027.24  |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID<br>ONLY NO BID<br>DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| RS-2688           | An undivided 243008640/244944000 interest in & to the SW4 Section 8 T102N, R74W  | FARM<br>160 GRASS<br>HAY       | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,680.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,160.00   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID<br>ONLY NO BID<br>DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| RS-2373           | 373102999696627200/3741852993278 an undivided 40000 interest in & to Lots 4, 5, 6, 8, NE4SW4 of Sec. 31 T103N, R78W                | FARM<br>160.99 GRASS<br>HAY    | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,760.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,496.00   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID<br>ONLY NO BID<br>DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| T4190-5           | SE4 Section 32, T97N, R74W   | 48 FARM<br>72 GRASS<br>38 HAY  | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,018.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$6,256.00   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| RS-4817           | Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 Section 4, T102N, R74W  | 102 FARM<br>GRASS<br>55.66 HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,055.80<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,513.12   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| RS-4782 & RS-4783 | Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 & SE4 Section 1 T101N, R74W   | 180 FARM<br>GRASS<br>123 HAY   | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$11,430.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$15,816.00 |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| T-4711            | SE4 Section 10, T96N, R74W   | 114 FARM<br>GRASS<br>38 HAY    | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$7,372.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,854.00   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| RS-4725           | An undivided 57254340/57657600 interest in and to NW4 Section 12 T96N, R74W  | 145 FARM<br>GRASS<br>6 HAY     | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,415.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$9,762.00   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID<br>ONLY NO BID<br>DEPOSIT REQUIRED |

# TRIPP COUNTY

| Tract No. | LEGAL DESCRIPTION   | ACRES                           | MINIMUM BID   | No. of Years | BID PER ACRE         | TOTAL AMOUNT                                     |
|-----------|---|---------------------------------|---|--------------|----------------------|--|
| 20        | RS-2643-5<br>Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 & SE4 of Sec. 4<br>T101N., R76W   | 161 FARM<br>152.23 GRASS<br>HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$10,424.29<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$14,583.98 |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 21        | RS-3764 & RS-3777<br>NW4NW4, S2NW4, SW4 of Sec. 25<br>&<br>E2 of Sec. 13 T102N., R78W                           | FARM<br>600 GRASS<br>HAY        | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$13,800.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$15,600.00 |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 22        | RS-4916<br>SE4 of Sec. 20 T102N., R78W  | FARM<br>160 GRASS<br>HAY        | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,680.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,160.00   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 23        | RS-2808<br>SE4 Section 9, T101N., R74W  | 109 FARM<br>47 GRASS<br>HAY     | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,097.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,698.00   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 24        | RS-4840<br>SW4 of Sec. 25 T101N., R77W  | 87 FARM<br>73 GRASS<br>HAY      | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,931.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,078.00   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 25        | RS-4366<br>N2N2SE4, N2S2N2SE4 of Sec. 30<br>T100N., R78W  | 53 FARM<br>7 GRASS<br>HAY       | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,489.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,722.00   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 26        | RS-3299<br>An undivided<br>1222412310/123451760 interest in<br>and to the NE4 Section 11, T101N,<br>R77W        | FARM<br>158 GRASS<br>HAY        | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,634.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,108.00   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID<br>ONLY NO BID<br>DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 27        | T4304<br>Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 of Sec. 4 T99N.,<br>R78W  | 80 FARM<br>77.16 GRASS<br>HAY   | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,565.92<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$7,286.16   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 28        | RS-2632<br>An undivided 1566/1620 interest in<br>and to the S2 Section 28, T101N,<br>R76W                       | 145 FARM<br>167 GRASS<br>HAY    | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$10,076.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$13,912.00 |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID<br>ONLY NO BID<br>DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 29        | RS-2774<br>An undivided 76267800/76545000<br>interest in and to Lot 2, S2NE4NE4,<br>S2NE4 of Sec. 6 T99N., R74W | 56 FARM<br>81.86 GRASS<br>HAY   | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,863.80<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$6,315.52   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID<br>ONLY NO BID<br>DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 30        |   | FARM                            | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,942.00   |              | FARM                 |  |

# TRIPP COUNTY

| Tract No. | LEGAL DESCRIPTION   | ACRES                             | MINIMUM BID   | No. of Years | BID PER ACRE         | TOTAL AMOUNT                                     |
|-----------|---|-----------------------------------|---|--------------|----------------------|--|
| RS-2558   | E2NE4 Section 12, T95N, R77W  | 62 GRASS<br>14 HAY                | Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,060.00  |              | GRASS<br>HAY         |  |
| 31        | RS-2704-5<br>An undivided 59579520/59875200 interest in and to Lots 3, 4, E2SW4, SE4 Section 31 T100N, R74W   | 154.20 FARM<br>GRASS<br>153 HAY   | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$11,220.60<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$15,073.20 |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID<br>ONLY NO BID<br>DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 32        | RS-4198<br>an undivided 11410/12600 interest in & to SE4 of Sec. 13 T96N, R74W  | FARM<br>158 GRASS<br>HAY          | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,634.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,108.00   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID<br>ONLY NO BID<br>DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 33        | RS-4797<br>an undivided 26902800/27216000 in and to NW4 Section 15 T102N, R75W  | 50 FARM<br>110 GRASS<br>HAY       | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,214.68<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$7,286.16   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID<br>ONLY NO BID<br>DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 34        | RS-1726 & RS-1726-A<br>An undivided 62099321684400/66936581712000 interest in and to the N2 & SW4 Section 14 & An undivided 61036836260400/6693658171200 interest in and to the SE4 Section 15, T102N, R77W | FARM<br>640 GRASS<br>HAY          | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$14,720.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$16,640.00 |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID<br>ONLY NO BID<br>DEPOSIT REQUIRED |
| 35        | T2630<br>NW4 of Sec. 20 T101N, R76W   | 102.50 FARM<br>52.87 GRASS<br>HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,016.94<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,456.84   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 36        | RS-2585-5<br>W2 Section 25 T102N, R77W  | FARM<br>320 GRASS<br>HAY          | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$7,360.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,320.00   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 37        | RS-2623<br>Lots 1, 2, E2NW4 Section 7 T101N, R76W   | 52 FARM<br>101.50 GRASS<br>HAY    | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,570.50<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$6,071.00   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 38        | RS-155 & RS-5667<br>NE4 & SW4 Section 23 T42N, R26W   | FARM<br>309.90 GRASS<br>HAY       | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,873.75<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,113.35   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |  |
| 39        | RS-4303<br>an undivided 6578426400/6899256000 in and to Lots 3, 4, E2SW4 Section 18 T100N, R75W   | FARM<br>143.95 GRASS<br>HAY       | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,310.85<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,742.70   |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY | PER ACRES BID<br>ONLY NO BID<br>DEPOSIT REQUIRED |

# TRIPP COUNTY

| Tract No. | LEGAL DESCRIPTION                                  | ACRES                       | MINIMUM BID  | No. of Years | BID PER ACRE         | TOTAL AMOUNT<br><small>DEPOSIT REQUIRED</small> |
|-----------|--|-----------------------------|--|--------------|----------------------|---|
| 40        | T4883<br>NW4 of Sec. 32 T101N, R78W<br>T100N, R78W | 156 FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY    | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,214.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$10,428.00 |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |   |
| 41        | T2707<br>SW4 Section 36 T102N, R77W                | 160 FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY    | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,920.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,160.00  |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |   |
| 42        | T11209<br>NW4 Section 26 T102N, R75W               | 115 FARM<br>GRASS<br>34 HAY | Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,203.00<br>Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$8,678.00  |              | FARM<br>GRASS<br>HAY |   |