

2023 LEASE ADVERTISEMENT MELLETTTE COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT
1	NW4 of Sec. 17 & NE4 of Sec. 18 T43N., R26W	FARM 320 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,200.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,280.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
2	S2SE4 Section 26 T42N, R33W	FARM 80 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$800.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,280.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
3	NE4 Section 36 T41N, R27W	FARM 131 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,310.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,161.50		FARM GRASS HAY	
4	SW4NW4 of Sec. 23 T43N., R30W	FARM 40 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$400.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$660.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
5	NE4SW4 Section 8, T44N, R30W	FARM 32 GRASS 8 HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$440.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$660.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
6	N2NW4 Section 29 T42N, R32W	FARM 40 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$400.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$660.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
8	NW4SW4 Section 15, T44N, R30W	FARM 40 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$400.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$660.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
9	Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 Section 3 T43N, R32W	FARM 159.46 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,594.60 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,631.09		FARM GRASS HAY	
10	Lots 1, 2, E2NW4 Section 19 T44N, R32W	FARM 151.60 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,516.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,501.40		FARM GRASS HAY	
11	SE4 Section 3 T41N, R25W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
12	An undivided 563262840/571536000 interest in and to the S2 Section 2, T41N, R25W	FARM 320 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,280.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
13	NE4 Section 16 T40N, R32W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
14	NW4 Section 30 T40N, R33W	FARM 155 GRASS	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,550.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,452.50		FARM GRASS	

MELLETE COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT
T3401	NW4 Section 22 T40N, R32W	HAY	Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,557.50		HAY	
15	RS-3406	160 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
16	T2081	160 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,200.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,800.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
17	RS-363	160 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
18	T3556	158.45 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,584.50 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,614.43		FARM GRASS HAY	
19	T5597-A	68 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,470.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,561.50		FARM GRASS HAY	
20	T5594	160 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
21	T11617	160 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
22	T1546-B	160 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
23	RS-6057	158 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,975.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,607.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
24	T5579	102 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,620.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,527.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
25	T513	160 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
26	RS-752	39.93 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$499.13 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$658.85		FARM GRASS HAY	

MELLETTTE COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT
27	An undivided 26066880/26127360 interest in and to Lots 1, 2, SE4NE4 of Sec. 3 T40N., R26W	154.30 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1928.75 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
28	SE4 Section 5 T40N, R26W	160 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
29	An undivided 114576/127008 interest in and to S2 Section 11 T40N, R27W	62 FARM GRASS HAY 130 GRASS HAY 125 HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$5,890.50 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$7,065.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
30	An undivided 15080/15120 interest in and to NW4 Section 22 & An undivided 22640/22680 interest in and to SE4 & An undivided 10880/108864 interest in and to NE4 of Sec. 21 T41N, R26W	480 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$6,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$7,920.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
31	SW4 of Sec. 17 T41N., R26W	90 FARM GRASS HAY 59 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,390.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,123.50		FARM GRASS HAY	
32	SW4 of Sec. 4 T41N., R26W	86 FARM GRASS HAY 74 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,645.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,231.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
33	Lots 2, 3, 4, SW4NW4 of Sec. 2 Lot 1 & 5, N2SE4, S2SW4, SENE4, SW4SE4 of Sec. 3 Lot 1, W2E2, SW4, SE4NE4 of Sec. 10 Lot 1 of Sec. 11 N2NW4 of Sec. 15 T43N., R29W	68 FARM GRASS HAY 771.67 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$9,076.70 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$15,112.56		FARM GRASS HAY	
34	An undivided 59976/60480 interest in and to Lot 1, NE4NW4, S2NW4 of Sec. 13 T43N., R29W	91 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,866.50 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,185.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
35	Lot 2, NW4NW4, S2NW4 of Sec. 9 T43N., R29W	135 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,687.50 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,227.50		FARM GRASS HAY	
36	SW4 of Sec. 3 T41N., R27W	160 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	

MELLETTTE COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT
37	RS-1982 An undivided 498120/510300 interest in and to the NW4 Section 12 T40N, R33W	FARM 155.50 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,943.75 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,565.75		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
38	T111625 W2SE4 of Sec. 27 T43N, R25W	FARM 77.5 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$775.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,278.75		FARM GRASS HAY	
39	RS-131 An undivided 405720/408240 interest in and to NW4 of Sec. 14 T41N, R27W	FARM 104 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,064.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,676.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
40	T111106 SW4 of Sec. 10 T41N, R26W	FARM 150 GRASS 6 HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,060.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,349.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
41	RS-28 NW4 of Section 17 T41N, R26W	FARM 90 GRASS 70 HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,710.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,305.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
42	T508 NE4 Section 20 T43N, R25W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
43	RS-856 An undivided 282677/47200/282910320000 interest in and to SE4 of Sec. 22 T43N, R26W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
44	RS-818-5A & RS-818-5B An undivided 4309489800/4358914560 interest in and to NW4 Section 16 & An undivided 4272012360/4358914560 interest in and to NE4 of Sec. 17 T43N, R26W	FARM 320 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,280.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
45	RS-867 An undivided 4910642352/5085400320 interest in and to NW4 of Sec. 23 T43N, R25W	FARM 136 GRASS 20 HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,534.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,090.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
46	T555 N2 of Sec. 34 T42N, R27W	FARM 51 GRASS 269 HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,710.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$6,223.50		FARM GRASS HAY	
47	RS-581-A E2NE4 of Sec. 18 T42N, R25W	FARM 80 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,520.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,800.00		FARM GRASS HAY	

MELLETTTE COUNTY

Tract No.		LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT
48	T566	SE4 of Sec. 5 T41N., R27W	160 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
49	T5634 & T5633	SW4 & SE4 of Sec. 9 T41N., R27W	320 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,200.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,280.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
50	T344-A	SE4 of Sec. 35 T42N., R27W	160 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
51	T3758 & T3758-A	Lots 3, 4 S2S2NW4 & N2S2NW4 of Sec. 4 T42N., R27W	156.49 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,129.80 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,477.15		FARM GRASS HAY	
52	T11283	SW4 of Sec. 11 T43N., R28W	160 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
53	T3093	NE4 of Section 11 T43N., R28W	70 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,300.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,935.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
54	T11069	Lot 4 Section 15 & N2 Section 22 T43N., R25W	329.70 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,297.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,440.05		FARM GRASS HAY	
55	T11147	NW4NE4, S2NE4 of Section 33 T43N., R25W	54 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,740.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,979.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
56	T3615 & T2388-5	E2SE4 of Sec. 27 & NW4 of Sec. 35 T43N., R25W	50 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,900.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,885.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
57	T5760	Lots 1, 2, E2NW4 of Sec. 7 T43N., R27W	103 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,087.95 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,632.95		FARM GRASS HAY	
58	T11217	Lots 1, 2, S2NE4 of Sec. 1 T43N., R28W	157.50 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,150.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,512.50		FARM GRASS HAY	
59	RS-95-E	NE4NE4 of Sec. 16 T42N., R27W	40 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$500.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$660.00		FARM GRASS HAY	

MELLETE COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT
60	T11627 NW4NE4 of Sec. 17 T43N., R25W	FARM 40 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$400.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$660.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
61	T348 SE4 of Sec. 27 T41N., R26W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
62	RS-343 an undivided 15080/15120 interest in & to the NE4 Section 22 T41N, R26W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
63	RS-349 SE4 Section 35 T41N, R26W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
64	T11598 W2 of Sec. 35 T44N., R30W	FARM 320 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,200.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,280.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
65	T929 W2 of Sec. 15 T43N., R30W	FARM 317 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,200.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,280.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
66	RS-732-5 An undivided 115993231200/117355392000 interest in and to south of the road in the W2SW4 of section 17, and Lot 1, NE4NW4, N2NE4 Section 19, T42N, R28W	FARM 178.11 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,226.38 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,938.82		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
67	RS-2538 An undivided 482880/483840 interest in and to Lot 1, 2, N2SW4, SW4SW4 Section 26 T45N, R31W	136 FARM 32.19 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,686.38 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,291.14		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
68	RS-4008-5A SE4 of Sec. 4 T44N., R31W	100 FARM 60 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,900.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,490.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
69	RS-2540-A & T2540-B Lot 2, N2SE4 Sec. 35 & NW4SW4 of Sec. 36 T45N, R31W	FARM 158.56 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,882.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,616.24		FARM GRASS HAY	
70	RS-4005 SW4 of Sec. 35 T45N., R31W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
71	T5536 NW4 of Sec. 35 T40N., R25W	158 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,160.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,530.00		FARM GRASS HAY	

MELLETTTE COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT
72	an undivided 1/4 of 1440 interest in & to the Lots 1, 2, E2NW4 Section 19 T43N, R28W	82 FARM 69.87 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$ Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED
73	SE4 of Sec. 24 T43N, R29W	149 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,490.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,458.50		FARM GRASS HAY	
74	N2 of Sec. 26 T40N, R32W	140 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,800.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,900.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
75	N2NE4, SW4NE4 of Sec. 16 T40N, R27W	120 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,200.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$1,980.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
76	NE4 of Sec. 23 T40N, R32W	140 FARM 20 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,660.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,230.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
77	E2E2W2SE4, E2W2E2SW4SE4, E2SE4 of Sec. 14 T43N, R28W	86 FARM 19 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,910.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,323.50		FARM GRASS HAY	
78	NE4 of Sec. 20 T44N, R30W	160 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
79	Lots 3 & 4 Section 19, T44N, R30W	95.35 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$1,907.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,337.25		FARM GRASS HAY	
80	E2 Section 7 T40N, R27W	FARM 320 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,280.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
81	SE4 Section 7 T41N, R25W	FARM 160 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,640.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
82	SW4 Section 26 T40N, R25W	156 FARM GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,914.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,460.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
83	Lots 1, 2, E2NW4 Section 18 T41N, R25W	FARM 164.09 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2051.13 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$2,707.49		FARM GRASS HAY	

MELLETTTE COUNTY

Tract No.	LEGAL DESCRIPTION	ACRES	MINIMUM BID	No. of Years	BID PER ACRE	TOTAL AMOUNT
84	N2 Section 28 T41N, R25W	FARM 320 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$4,000.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,280.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
85	NE4 of Sec. 23 T41N, R25W	FARM GRASS 160 HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,400.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$3,520.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
86	SE4 & SW4 of Sec. 24 T41N, R25W	FARM GRASS 244 HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,660.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,368.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
87	SW4 of Sec. 23 T42N, R26W	100 FARM 60 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$2,600.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$4,490.00		FARM GRASS HAY	
88	Lots 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, SE4SW4, S2SE4, NE4SE4 Section 2 T43N, R27W	FARM 308.40 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$3,084.00 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$5,088.60		FARM GRASS HAY	
89	An undivided 9360336205/943044000 interest in and to Lots 3, 4, E2SW4, SE4 of Sec. 18, Lots 3, 4, E2SW4, SE4 of Sec. 19, An undivided 13888123460/13888324800 interest in and to Lots 1, 2, E2NW4, NE4 of Sec. 30, Lots 3, 4, E2SW4 of Sec. 30, N2SE4 of Sec. 30 & S2SE4 of Sec. 30 T42N, R26W	FARM 1,310.85 GRASS HAY	Tribal Member Minimum Bid: \$15,985.63 Non-Member Minimum Bid: \$21,629.03		FARM GRASS HAY	PER ACRES BID ONLY NO BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED